
Dear Colleagues, 

 

On behalf of the Harvard Department of Statistics, I am pleased to announce that we are 
seeking applications for a tenure-track professor appointment in statistics.  The appointment is 
expected to begin on July 1, 2025.  I would appreciate if you could distribute the announcement below 
within your institution and to everyone you know who may be interested.  

 

Applicants should also note that their applications must be submitted no later than December 1, 2024.  

   

Sincerely,    

Samuel Kou  (sent on behalf of Chair Kou by Administrative Coordinator Emily Palmer)  

   

Samuel Kou   

Professor of Statistics and    

Chair of the Department of Statistics  

Faculty of Arts & Sciences, Harvard University  

kou@stat.harvard.edu   

 

 

Harvard Department of Statistics, Tenure-Track Professor Description:  

 

The Harvard Department of Statistics seeks to appoint a tenure-track professor in Statistics. The 
appointment is expected to begin on July 1, 2025. The tenure-track professor will be responsible for 
teaching at the undergraduate and graduate levels. We seek strong candidates in any field of statistics 
and probability as well as in any interdisciplinary areas where innovative and principled use of statistics 
and/or probability is of vital importance. 

Basic Qualifications:  A doctorate or terminal degree in statistics or a related discipline is required by the 
time the appointment begins. 

  

Additional Qualifications:  Statistics celebrates the multiple dimensions of diversity that each member of 
our community offers, including diversity of background, perspective, and lived experience. We strongly 
welcome applications from persons from underrepresented groups. 

https://nam04.safelinks.protection.outlook.com/?url=https%3A%2F%2Facademicpositions.harvard.edu%2Fpostings%2F13744&data=05%7C02%7Cmcghee%40stat.fsu.edu%7C8adc1b31188242330ea008dcd111f226%7Ca36450ebdb0642a78d1b026719f701e3%7C0%7C0%7C638615122226958493%7CUnknown%7CTWFpbGZsb3d8eyJWIjoiMC4wLjAwMDAiLCJQIjoiV2luMzIiLCJBTiI6Ik1haWwiLCJXVCI6Mn0%3D%7C0%7C%7C%7C&sdata=zAPzvymLWnDmtJEncNKZxLm0YvUyKUEAhTa2Rz8nI5c%3D&reserved=0


  

Special Instructions: Please submit the following materials through the ARIeS portal 
(https://academicpositions.harvard.edu/postings/13744 ). Applications must be submitted no later than 
December 1, 2024. 

  

1. Cover letter 

2. Curriculum Vitae 

3. Teaching/advising statement (describing your philosophy and practices as well as your approach to 
creating a learning environment in which students are encouraged to ask questions and share their 
ideas) 

4. Research statement 

5. Service Statement (describing your efforts to strengthen academic communities, e.g., your 
department, institution, and/or professional societies.) 

6. Representative publications, if applicable 

7. Names and contact information of 3 to 5 references who will be asked by a system-generated email to 
upload a letter of recommendation once a candidate’s application has been submitted. Three letters of 
recommendation are required, and the application is considered complete only when at least 3 letters 
have been received. At least one letter must come from someone who has not served as the candidate’s 
undergraduate, graduate, or postdoctoral advisor. 

  

The health of our community is a priority for Harvard University. With that in mind, we strongly 
encourage all employees to be up-to-date on CDC-recommended vaccines. 

  

Harvard is an equal opportunity employer and all qualified applicants will receive consideration for 
employment without regard to race, color, sex, gender identity, sexual orientation, religion, creed, 
national origin, ancestry, age, protected veteran status, disability, genetic information, military service, 
pregnancy and pregnancy-related conditions, or other protected status. 

 

Department of Statistics 

Science Center, 400 Suite, 1 Oxford Street, 

Cambridge, MA 02138-2901 

Statistics@fas.harvard.edu 

 
 

https://nam04.safelinks.protection.outlook.com/?url=https%3A%2F%2Facademicpositions.harvard.edu%2Fpostings%2F13744&data=05%7C02%7Cmcghee%40stat.fsu.edu%7C8adc1b31188242330ea008dcd111f226%7Ca36450ebdb0642a78d1b026719f701e3%7C0%7C0%7C638615122226970955%7CUnknown%7CTWFpbGZsb3d8eyJWIjoiMC4wLjAwMDAiLCJQIjoiV2luMzIiLCJBTiI6Ik1haWwiLCJXVCI6Mn0%3D%7C0%7C%7C%7C&sdata=n4KIktnlsjx%2Bhnhqu%2B0Oxtqo7Sj4PrK7q0NSBKLEb44%3D&reserved=0

