
Biostatistician, Assistant Professor 

Research and Graduate Programs Department 

  

Position # 64331 (37691) 

  

The University of Missouri ‐ Kansas City School of Dentistry is seeking applications for a 
biostatistician/research methodologist.  The position is a 100% benefit eligible, full time, 12 
month, tenure-track faculty appointment at the rank of Assistant Professor in Research and 
Graduate Programs Department. Responsibilities include classroom instruction in research 
methods and statistics for School of Dentistry students (advanced education dental specialty 
residents and graduate students-MS/PhD).  Other responsibilities include assisting faculty, 
postdoctoral fellows, and students in research activities, specifically in research design, data 
management, data analysis, and advanced statistical methods for oral, dental, and craniofacial 
biomedical and biomechanics research. The faculty member is expected to engage in research 
collaboration and consultation with School of Dentistry faculty, i.e. development of extramural 
applications, scholarly publications and presentations.  A PhD in research methodology/statistics 
with training in advanced statistical methods including modelling is required with a track record 
of being a co-investigator on funded grants and publications highly desirable.  Candidates should 
understand and support the University’s vision, mission, and values. Salary and rank will be 
commensurate with experience. Interviews of qualified candidates will begin immediately and 
continue until the position is filled. 

  

  

UMKC is part of the University of Missouri, with excellent fringe benefits package. Applicants 
should submit a letter of interest, a CV, names and contact information for three references in 
one document online to www.umkc.edu/jobs.  Please direct inquiries and correspondence to: 
Dr. Pamela Overman, (overmanp@umkc.edu) Associate Dean for Academic Affairs, UMKC 
School of Dentistry. UMKC is an equal access, equal opportunity, affirmative action employer 
that is fully committed to achieving a diverse faculty and staff.  Persons are selected on the basis 
of ability without regard to race, color, sex, age, national origin, sexual orientation, religion, 
disability, or veteran status. All final candidates will be required to pass a criminal background 
check prior to beginning employment. 
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